
Town of Ridgefield  Diesel, 87 Octane Gasoline, Heating Oil Fuel Bid FY 21

BID 20-12 Delivery from July 2020 to June 2021

Bid Due:

1/24/20 at 11am via invitation only / faxed or e-mailed price 01/24/20 01/24/20 01/24/20 01/24/20

 145,000 GA Diesel 55,000 GA 87 Oct 10,000 GA Heating Oil #2 7,000 GA WPCA Diesel

Company Name Contact Phone Fax Price p/Gl Price p/Gl

Standard Oil Bill Prince 203-334-5532x3002 203-337-3529 $1.9400 $1.7025 $2.8690 $2.8690

Bridgeport, CT

Santa Buckley Energy Bridget Murphy 203-336-3541 x 1334 203-367-2412 $1.9254 $1.6534 no bid no bid BID WITHDRAWN 1/24/20

Bridgeport, CT

East River Colleen 203-453-1200 203-453-3899 $1.9756 $1.6905 no bid no bid 

Guilford, CT 203-453-1200 x2015

Mitchell Oil Matt Mitchell 203-744-0600 203-743-7978 $1.9249 $1.6685 no bid no bid AWARDED 1/24/20 - 55,000 GA 87 Octane

Danbury, CT

Dime Oil Tracy Cyr 203-754-5334 203-754-0790 $1.9433 $1.6934 $2.1360 $2.1302

Waterbury CT

Branchville Oil Paul Ciavarelli 544-8460 544-0060 no bid no bid $2.1490 $2.1490

Ridgefield, CT

Petroleum Traders Gayle Newton 800-348-3705x6347 206-207-6347 $1.8984 $1.6865 no bid no bid AWARDED 1/24/20 - 145,000 Diesel

Fort Wayne , NJ

** Note : 87 Octane price does not include Ct Gross receipts tax on top of the bid price.

Highlighted prices awarded bid for that product

NO AWARD of the 10,000 gallons Heating Oil or the 7,000 gallons WPCA Diesel at this time

Jacob Muller Purchasing Director

Town of Ridgefield


