
Town of Ridgefield  Diesel, 87 Octane Gasoline, Heating OilFY 20

BID 19-07 Delivery from July 2019 to June 2020

12/7/18 at 11am via invitation only / faxed or e-mailed price12/07/18 12/07/18 12/07/18 12/07/18

 150,000 GA Diesel 52,000 GA 87 Oct 10,000 GA Heating Oil #2 7,000 GA WPCA Diesel

Company Name Price p/Gl Price p/Gl

Standard Oil $2.0700 $1.7400 $2.6090 $2.4200 AWARDED 52,000 Gallon 87 Octane Bid 12/7/18

Bridgeport, CT

Buckley Oil $2.1033 $1.7610 $2.4460 SC + $1.100 VAR

Bridgeport, CT

East River $2.1311 $1.8116 $2.5751 $2.3811 * Includes taxes (L.U.S.T. and Federal Spill Fund Tax)

Guilford, CT $2.1280 $1.8087 $2.5720 $2.3780 ** removes taxes as listed in bid for comparison 

Mitchell Oil $2.0660 $1.7806 no bid no bid AWARDED 150,000 Gallon Diesel Bid 12/7/18

Danbury, CT

Dime Oil $2.1040 $1.7610 $2.2597 $2.1766 AWARDED 10,000 GA Heating Oil #2 & 7,000 GA WPCA Diesel Bid 12/7/18

Waterbury CT

Branchville Oil no bid no bid $2.4800 $2.5000

Ridgefield, CT

Petroleum Traders $2.1023 $1.7429 no bid no bid 

Fort Wayne , NJ

** Note : 87 Octane price does not include Ct Gross receipts tax on top of the bid price.

Highlighted prices awarded bid for that product

Jacob Muller

Town of Ridgefield


